

October Invoice

<u>Time Keeper</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>
M. Schechter	124.0*	310
G. Reavis	75.6	385
J. Merkel	6.0	330
S. DiJulio	4.7	490
A. Ostdiek	2.4	395
R. Givens	2.7	210
J. Eckert	4.5	220
K Baisden	7.8	170
B. Louzin	0.2	170

Total Hours Expended:	227.9
Total Hours Billed	224.7*
Total Fees	74,446.00
Total Costs	11,305.21

* 3.2 Hours of time spent was at no charge

November Invoice

<u>Time Keeper</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>
M. Schechter	10.2	310
G. Reavis	13.5	385
R. Givens	13.5	210
A. Ostdiek	4.0	395
J. Merkel	1.5	330
S. DiJulio	0.8	490

Total Hours Billed:	43.5
Total Fees	13,443.50
Total Costs	12,172.48

FOSTER PEPPER P.L.L.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

1111 THIRD AVENUE SUITE 3400

SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98101

206-447-4400

TAX ID. #91-0606972

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010
Invoice No. 961618City of Puyallup
Attn: Cheryl Carlson, City Attorney
333 S. Meridian
Puyallup, WA 98371

Matter No. 109

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
09/01/10	P. DiJulio	Working with M. Schechter and G. Reavis on approach to mediation; telephone conference with Cheryl Carlson regarding same	0.9	432.00
09/01/10	G. Reavis	Work on summary showing facts that APD knew or should have known of Landfill D and planned accordingly; telephone conference with JAMS regarding mediation; telephone call with opposing counsel (Jeff Kray) regarding agreement to hire mediator; telephone conference with client (Cheryl Carlson) regarding mediation; office conference with M. Schechter regarding City Council meeting and related matters	5.0	1,925.00
09/01/10	M. Schechter	Discuss mediation and discovery issues with G. Reavis and Jeff Kray; discuss site investigation with Anne Udalay; attention to e-mails regarding mediation and discovery; review case materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation	2.6	806.00
09/02/10	G. Reavis	Review e-mail from Anne Udalay on dates that are necessary to begin work, collect and analyze data and present findings; telephone conference with M. Schechter regarding same	2.7	1,039.50

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
09/02/10	M. Schechter	Discuss case strategy and issues with G. Reavis; discuss mediation and case issues with Jeff Kray; attention to e-mails regarding mediation; draft letter to opposing counsel regarding site investigation; discuss mediation and remediation issues with Michael Spillane	4.9	1,519.00
09/07/10	P. DiJulio	Following up with M. Schechter and G. Reavis regarding mediation and site investigation schedule	0.2	96.00
09/07/10	G. Reavis	Review documents referring to source of methane; office conference with M. Schechter regarding draft mediation brief and other matters; review and make comments on mediation memorandum; office conference with S. DiJulio and M. Schechter regarding status of case and strategy for mediation; review documents from APD attorneys regarding documents to be produced; review and sign letter to Jeff Kray regarding schedule for property investigation	5.4	2,079.00
09/07/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement issues and Council briefing with Cheryl Carlson; discuss case strategy and issues including potential settlement scenarios with G. Reavis and S. DiJulio; review and analysis of technical documents and mediation materials provided by plaintiffs; discuss case and mediations issues with Jeff Kray; review and analysis of file documents in preparation for mediation and ongoing litigation; draft and revise mediation statement supporting City's position; discuss technical materials with Anne Udaloy and Michael Spillane; draft e-mail correspondence to George	13.4	4,154.00

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		Johnson regarding potential expert analysis of plaintiffs' claimed interest/fee damages		
09/08/10	K. Baisden	Analyze database and gather documents per M. Schechter	0.2	34.00
09/08/10	G. Reavis	Prepare for mediation; review mediation briefs and documents supporting same; office conferences with M. Schechter to prepare for mediation	4.2	1,617.00
09/08/10	M. Schechter	Draft and revise mediation materials; discuss with G. Reavis, discuss with Jeff Kray, review and analysis of file technical materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation; discuss economic damage issues with George Johnson	10.2	3,162.00
09/09/10	K. Baisden	Analyze database and gather mediation exhibits per M. Schechter	0.5	85.00
09/09/10	P. DiJulio	Working on draft mediation letter in coordination with M. Schechter and G. Reavis regarding same	1.1	528.00
09/09/10	G. Reavis	Review and revise draft mediation brief and supply comments; meeting with S. DiJulio and M. Schechter regarding interpretation of release as related to MTCA liability; office conference with M. Schechter regarding mediation brief and related matters; review 1997 report relating landfill details and recommending Phase II; telephone conference with client (Cheryl Carlson) and M. Schechter regarding Council meeting and regarding mediation; telephone conference with opposing counsel (Jeff Kray) regarding discovery and related issues	5.8	2,233.00
09/09/10	M. Schechter	Draft mediation letter; discuss mediation issues with Cheryl Carlson, G. Reavis, S. DiJulio, and	15.1	4,681.00

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		opposing counsel; research and analysis regarding financial cost issues and APD calculations; draft e-mail regarding APD damage calculations; prepare materials for mediation; review side letter to Judge Terry Lukens		
09/10/10	K. Baisden	Coordinate with G. Reavis for mediation notebook of documentation regarding what APD knew or should have known	0.2	34.00
09/10/10	G. Reavis	Review documents and create selection to be used in notebook showing knowledge on part of APD; summarize major themes to ensure that evidence is available to support defenses; telephone conferences with M. Schechter regarding plaintiffs' mediation brief; review chronology for events related to when APD should have had notice of landfill/gas; review summary created by expert (Michael Spillane) relating to alternate means of construction given proximity to landfill; review charts of costs of same	6.0	2,310.00
09/10/10	M. Schechter	Revise and edit side letter to mediator Judge Terry Lukens; review and analysis of case materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation; discuss mediation and valuation issues with George Johnson; discuss mediation issues with Cheryl Carlson, G. Reavis, and opposing counsel; review and analysis of Plaintiffs' financial documentation in preparation for mediation; review prior and current mediation briefs; draft materials for use during mediation	12.5	3,875.00
09/11/10	K. Baisden	Analyze database and begin to gather	1.1	187.00

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		documents mediation notebook regarding what APD knew or should have known		
09/11/10	M. Schechter	Review and analysis of case materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation; review and analysis of Plaintiffs' financial documentation in preparation for mediation; review prior and current mediation briefs; draft materials for use during mediation	3.2	992.00
09/12/10	M. Schechter	Review and analysis of case materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation; review and analysis of Plaintiffs' financial documentation in preparation for mediation; review prior and current mediation briefs; draft materials for use during mediation; prepare for meetings with Plaintiffs and City Council	7.4	2,294.00
09/13/10	K. Baisden	Gather documents for mediation notebook per G. Reavis	3.0	510.00
09/13/10	P. DiJulio	Further attention to mediation issues	0.6	288.00
09/13/10	G. Reavis	Revise chart on when APD knew or should have known of landfill/gas; meetings with M. Schechter regarding strategy for council meeting; prepare for mediation	5.6	2,156.00
09/13/10	M. Schechter	Discuss mediation issues with George Johnson and G. Reavis; review financial and technical materials; prepare materials and notes for mediation; discuss case issues with S. DiJulio; participate in ER 408 conference with Plaintiffs' representatives, opposing counsel, and George Johnson to identify basis for financial claims; attention to e-mails regarding mediation issues	11.1	3,441.00

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
09/14/10	K. Baisden	Prepare documents for mediation per G. Reavis	1.7	289.00
09/14/10	P. DiJulio	Working with M. Schechter in preparation for mediation and addressing further issues regarding financial background for plaintiffs' claim	0.6	288.00
09/14/10	J. Eckert	Attention to successor liability under common law and MTCA when two private parties indemnify each other in an executed settlement agreement	2.0	440.00
09/14/10	G. Reavis \$ 385/HR	Prepare for mediation (5.0); attend Puyallup City Council executive session meeting (3.2)	8.2	3,157.00
09/14/10	M. Schechter	Review and analysis of case materials in preparation for mediation and ongoing representation; review and analysis of Plaintiffs' financial documentation in preparation for mediation; review prior and current mediation briefs; draft materials for use during mediation	6.7	2,077.00
09/14/10	M. Schechter \$ 310/HR	Prepare for and present mediation analysis to City Council in executive session	3.2	N/C
09/15/10	K. Baisden	Assist M. Schechter with documentation for mediation	1.1	187.00
09/15/10	P. DiJulio	Conferring with City Attorney (with G. Reavis and M. Schechter) in preparation for mediation; follow up confirmation of mediation, preliminary settlement and terms of same; office conference with M. Schechter regarding schedule for presentation of settlement for counsel consideration	0.9	432.00
09/15/10	J. Eckert	Identify required elements needed under common law for a covenant to run with the land; analyze elements to determine whether covenant ran	2.5	550.00

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		with land in question		
09/15/10	A. Ostdiek	Consult with M. Schechter regarding feasibility of settlement financing	0.6	237.00
09/15/10	G. Reavis	Prepare for and attend mediation with Judge Terry Lukens and client (Cheryl Carlson)	7.5	2,887.50
09/15/10	M. Schechter	Prepare for and participate in mediation between City and plaintiffs with Cheryl Carlson, G. Reavis and Michael Spillane; assist in drafting term sheet at conclusion of mediation; discuss case issues and status with S. DiJulio	13.4	4,154.00
09/16/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up regarding feasibility of financing settlement	0.3	118.50
09/16/10	M. Schechter	Draft case value analysis; discuss case issues with S. DiJulio and G. Reavis; discuss settlement and ongoing gas issues with Jeff Kray and Anne Udaloy; review gas management documents	4.3	1,333.00
09/17/10	R. Givens	Confer with M. Schechter regarding litigation guarantees needed; online research of property information; telephone call to Commonwealth Title to request litigation guarantees based on settlement amounts	1.2	252.00
09/17/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up with M. Schechter and W. Tonkin regarding feasibility of financing settlement on tax-exempt basis	0.9	355.50
09/17/10	M. Schechter	Discuss litigation guarantees with S. DiJulio and R. Givens; attention to e-mail regarding mediation follow-up and settlement financing; review and analysis of gas management documents for settlement issues	2.6	806.00
09/20/10	R. Givens	Attention to computation of costs of litigation guarantees as based on settlement amount and on assessed value of property; discuss	1.2	252.00

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		timeframes with title company and M. Schechter; put orders on hold awaiting approval of costs from client		
09/20/10	G. Reavis	Review expert witness invoice and forward to client; review plaintiffs' environmental reports prepared by SCS	1.2	462.00
09/20/10	M. Schechter	Attention to e-mail regarding settlement issues and litigation guarantees; review gas management materials	1.4	434.00
09/21/10	B. Louzin	Identify, locate and deliver copy of IRS Notice 89-9, regarding hazardous waste remediation, to W. Tonkin	0.2	35.00
09/21/10	G. Reavis	Prepare draft of presentation to the City on mediation and its results	2.2	847.00
09/21/10	M. Schechter	Attention to issues regarding settlement agreement including litigation guarantees; discuss same with Cheryl Carlson, Commonwealth Title, and S. DiJulio; review gas management documents	1.4	434.00
09/22/10	R. Givens	Communications with Randy McCrory at Commonwealth Title regarding parcel map and high volume of vesting deeds on property	0.1	21.00
09/22/10	G. Reavis	Telephone conference with M. Schechter regarding title policy and possible indemnity agreement to deal with possible absent parties; telephone conference with opposing counsel (Jeff Kray) regarding same and regarding draft settlement agreement; review plaintiffs' mediation submission and cleanup costs	2.1	808.50
09/22/10	M. Schechter	Review case materials for documentation necessary for bond financing of settlement; discuss same	0.9	279.00

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
09/23/10	R. Givens	with S. DiJulio Online research for Plat Maps to view and map location of properties; communications with title company regarding status of litigation guarantees	1.1	231.00
09/23/10	G. Reavis	Draft addition to notes for City Council meeting on September 28	0.9	346.50
09/23/10	M. Schechter	Participate in conference call with Anne Udaloj and Tom Zerkel regarding ongoing MTCA and Department of Ecology issues relating to settlement and gas mediation; discuss settlement issues and documentation for bond financing with opposing counsel; discuss settlement issues with G. Reavis; review Anne Udaloj letter regarding gas management issues pertaining to settlement	2.4	744.00
09/24/10	P. DiJulio	Attention to settlement status; conferring with M. Schechter and G. Reavis; telephone conference with City Attorney regarding delay in city council consideration of settlement; follow up with M. Schechter regarding communication with plaintiff's counsel	0.4	192.00
09/24/10	G. Reavis	Review memorandum from Anne Udaloj regarding Landfill D; office conference with M. Schechter regarding Council meeting and status of draft settlement agreement; office conference with M. Schechter and S. DiJulio regarding City Council and lack of draft settlement agreement; telephone conference with client (Cheryl Carlson) regarding same; office conference with M. Schechter and telephone conference with opposing counsel (Jeff Kray) regarding settlement agreement and	4.6	1,771.00

Client No. 40636

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
09/24/10	M. Schechter	terms thereof; telephone call to Judge Terry Lukens regarding delay in getting approval of settlement agreement; telephone call with Anne Udaloy regarding Landfill D and anticipated issues in settlement terms	1.2	372.00
09/27/10	J. Merkel	Discuss settlement issues with Jeff Kray and G. Reavis; discuss settlement and council issues with Cheryl Carlson, S. DiJulio, and G. Reavis; review materials to provide documentation for bond financing; discuss bond financing issues with J. Merkel	3.5	1,155.00
09/27/10	G. Reavis	Review documents regarding environmental remediation; office conference with W. Tonkin regarding details of "hard costs"	3.5	1,347.50
09/27/10	M. Schechter	Review notes from consultant (Anne Udaloy) regarding Landfill D and regulatory issues; draft e-mail to M. Schechter regarding edits to settlement agreement relating to same; draft e-mail to Ecology (Kristie Carevich) regarding same	0.6	186.00
09/28/10	J. Merkel	Discuss bond financing requirements with J. Merkel; review documents to support bond financing	2.5	825.00
09/28/10	G. Reavis	Work on language for settlement agreement; office conference with W. Tonkin regarding language; research regarding fees and operations expenses	0.9	346.50
09/28/10	M. Schechter	Review and analyze draft settlement agreement	1.4	434.00
09/29/10	R. Givens	Discuss bond financing issues with J. Merkel; review draft settlement agreement and draft proposed changes	0.3	63.00
		Telephone call with title company to check status of litigation guarantees		

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		for River Trail and Addison Green apartments; e-mail communications with M. Schechter updating him as to status of same		
09/29/10	G. Reavis	Telephone conference with opposing counsel (Jeff Kray) regarding dealing with cleanup and status of both properties as one site; review and edit draft settlement agreement; office conference with M. Schechter regarding same	2.7	1,039.50
09/29/10	M. Schechter	Attention to settlement agreement draft and edits; discuss same with Cheryl Carlson and G. Reavis; discuss bond financing issues and documentation needs with J. Merkel; discuss litigation guarantees with R. Givens	2.2	682.00
09/30/10	A. Ostdiek	Review draft settlement agreement and follow up regarding financing	0.6	237.00
09/30/10	G. Reavis	Review and revise draft settlement agreement; telephone conferences and office conferences with M. Schechter regarding draft agreement; review and analyze Ecology VCP guidance to determine whether site could be divided; telephone conference with Ecology AAG (Ivy Anderson) relating to MTCA issues regarding splitting sites; revise draft agreement again and make edits	5.9	2,271.50
09/30/10	M. Schechter	Revise and edit settlement agreement draft; discuss same with Cheryl Carlson, Michael Spillane, G. Reavis, and J. Merkel	1.9	589.00
		Total Hours	227.9	
		TOTAL FOR LEGAL SERVICES		\$74,446.00
		Color Photocopies		26.00
		Color Photocopies - 11x17		64.00
		Copies		115.80

October 21, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

	Print/Copies: B&W (unassembled, w/o staples) (incl. standard slips sheets)	0.16
09/02/10	Arbitrator/Mediator Fee - Mediation fee for 09/15/10, retainer fees for Hon. T. Lukens and reserved session time (15 hours)	1,775.00
09/07/10	Professional Services rendered and costs incurred by Brueggeman and Johnson Yeanoplos, PC for the period of 09/07/10 through 09/15/10 re City of Puyallup	8,994.25 <i>for 2009/10</i>
09/09/10	Legal Messenger - 15-minute rush delivery to T Lukens at 600 University St.	30.00
09/10/10	Legal Messenger - 15-minute rush delivery to T. Lukens at 600 University St.	30.00
09/10/10	Legal Messenger - 15-minute rush delivery to J. Kray at 1191 2nd Ave.	30.00
09/10/10	Legal Messenger - 15-minute rush delivery to S. Keehnel at 701 5th Ave.	30.00
09/13/10	Legal Messenger - Rush delivery to M. Spillane at 2200 6th Ave.	10.00
09/14/10	Arbitrator/Mediator Fee - Balance of mediation fees for additional time spent with Hon. T. Lukens from 09/14/10 through 09/17/10 re American Property Development, Inc. v. City of Puyallup	200.00
	TOTAL COSTS	\$11,305.21
	TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$85,751.21

paid 3/10
6/10

FOSTER PEPPER PLLC

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

1111 THIRD AVENUE SUITE 3400

SEATTLE, WASHINGTON 98101

206-447-4400

TAX ID. #91-0606972

Client No. 40636

November 16, 2010

Invoice No. 963714

City of Puyallup
Attn: Cheryl Carlson, City Attorney
333 S. Meridian
Puyallup, WA 98371

Matter No. 109

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
10/01/10	R. Givens	Communications with title company regarding status of litigation guarantees	0.1	21.00
10/01/10	G. Reavis	Review and revise draft settlement agreement; office conference with M. Schechter regarding same; review emails and correspondence with environmental consultants (Anne Udaloy and Michael Spillane); revise settlement agreement to modify environmental documents to be exchanged to coordinate systems	2.5	962.50
10/01/10	M. Schechter	Draft edits to settlement agreement; review settlement agreement edits and analysis from experts; discuss settlement issues with Jeff Kray and G. Reavis	1.4	434.00
10/04/10	R. Givens	Receive electronic links to Trustee's Sale Guarantees for River Trail Apartments and Addison Greens Apartments; download each and obtain hard copies of same for review	0.8	168.00
10/04/10	A. Ostdiek	Review proposed settlement offer and discuss same with M. Schechter	0.7	276.50
10/04/10	G. Reavis	Review draft settlement agreement; office conference with M. Schechter regarding same; telephone conference with expert witness (Anne Udaloy) to discuss additional	2.4	924.00

November 16, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		edits to settlement agreement; telephone conference with Ecology Site Manager (Scott Rose) regarding site and settlement status		
10/04/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement and gas management issues with G. Reavis and Anne Udaloy; revise and edit settlement agreement; discuss same with S. DiJulio; attention to emails regarding settlement agreement	2.9	899.00
10/05/10	P. DiJulio	Conferring with M. Schechter and G. Reavis regarding integration of prior hold harmless and indemnification provisions of settlement with Barovic into settlement with APD and approach to same	0.3	144.00
10/05/10	G. Reavis	Review email regarding draft settlement agreement; analyze effect of settlement language on the underlying contracts between the parties; telephone conference with M. Schechter regarding same; review contracts between the City and the Barovic estate to determine how to address contracts in settlement agreement	2.7	1,039.50
10/05/10	M. Schechter	Attention to settlement agreement issues including additional analysis on impact to existing rights under Barovic settlement agreement; discuss City Council issues with Cheryl Carlson and G. Reavis	2.5	775.00
10/06/10	P. DiJulio	Following up with M. Schechter regarding Council review process and email to client regarding same	0.2	96.00
10/06/10	R. Givens	Analyze litigation guarantees and underlying documents for River Trail Apartments and Addison Greens Apartments	4.7	987.00
10/06/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up conversations regarding	0.7	276.50

November 16, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
		financing feasibility and draft settlement agreement		
10/06/10	G. Reavis	Review and respond to emails relating to settlement agreement	0.6	231.00
10/06/10	M. Schechter	Attention to litigation guarantees and settlement agreement status	0.2	62.00
10/07/10	R. Givens	Analyze litigation guarantees and underlying documents for River Trail Apartments and Addison Greens Apartments	5.1	1,071.00
10/07/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up with finance team regarding settlement financing	0.2	79.00
10/08/10	R. Givens	Obtain missing underlying documents for litigation guarantees and review same; identify properties on large plat map; communication to M. Schechter regarding status of title review	1.2	252.00
10/08/10	M. Schechter	Discuss litigation guarantee issues with R. Givens and Randy McCrory of Commonwealth Title	0.4	124.00
10/11/10	R. Givens	Review chain of title provided by title company and numerous documents reflected thereon to analyze title vesting issue; confer with Randy McCrory at Commonwealth Title regarding vesting theory	1.7	357.00
10/11/10	J. Merkel	Draft memorandum regarding environmental remediation costs considered capital for bond financing	1.5	495.00
10/12/10	R. Givens	Meet with M. Schechter to discuss findings from review of chain of title; communications with title company to further discuss suspicions in connection with vesting and request for reconfirmation of same and copies of all vesting deeds	1.1	231.00
10/12/10	M. Schechter	Discuss litigation guarantee issues with R. Givens	0.2	62.00

November 16, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
10/13/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up on settlement offer and financing of settlement	0.4	158.00
10/13/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement issues with Jeff Kray; discuss same with Cheryl Carlson and G. Reavis	0.4	124.00
10/15/10	A. Ostdiek	Follow up with M. Schechter regarding draft proposed settlement	0.6	237.00
10/15/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement issues and bond support materials with Jeff Kray; discuss settlement timing issues with Cheryl Carlson and G. Reavis	0.3	93.00
10/18/10	A. Ostdiek	Confer with M. Schechter regarding settlement agreement	0.3	118.50
10/18/10	M. Schechter	Attention to settlement timing and bond support issues	0.1	31.00
10/19/10	A. Ostdiek	Discussions regarding settlement financing and timing	0.5	197.50
10/19/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement agreement issues and potential Council action with Cheryl Carlson, G. Reavis, and A. Ostdiek	0.8	248.00
10/20/10	P. DiJulio	Follow up with City Attorney regarding City Council actions	0.3	144.00
10/20/10	A. Ostdiek	Discuss timing of settlement and financing with M. Schechter	0.6	237.00
10/20/10	M. Schechter	Attention to communications regarding City Council action on settlement amount	0.2	62.00
10/25/10	G. Reavis	Telephone conference with Ecology Site Manager (Scott Rose) regarding parties, Ecology opinion to be issued, and status of settlement agreement; review settlement agreement to determine whether City can submit APD data to Ecology in the future; review most recent settlement agreement and discuss same with M. Schechter	1.8	693.00
10/25/10	M. Schechter	Discuss settlement issues with G. Reavis	0.2	62.00

November 16, 2010

In re Landfill Claim

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Amount
10/29/10	G. Reavis	Review and analyze Ecology letter addressing remediation proposed by Puyallup; telephone call to client (Cheryl Carlson) regarding same	2.3	885.50
10/31/10	M. Schechter	Review and analysis of draft settlement agreement	0.6	186.00
		Total Hours	43.5	
		TOTAL FOR LEGAL SERVICES		\$13,443.50
09/07/10		Professional Services rendered and costs incurred by Herrera Environmental Consultants through 08/27/10 re Puyallup Closed Landfill D		6,820.78
10/01/10		Professional Services - Professional services rendered and costs incurred through 10/01/10 by Herrera Environmental Consultants re Puyallup Closed Landfill D legal support		5,351.70
		TOTAL COSTS		\$12,172.48
		TOTAL AMOUNT DUE		\$25,615.98